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When studying the social phenomena in and around football, five major aspects of globalisation processes
become evident: international migration, the global flow of capital, the syncretistic nature of tradition and
modernity in contemporary culture, new experiences of time and space and the revolution in information
technologies.

In an exploration of these themes the collection provides insight into academic studies of football in
Portugal, Germany, England, Spain, Brazil, Angola, Mozambique, China, Japan, South Korea, Russia and
the USA. At examining football-related phenomena under the headings of nations and migration, myths and
business, the city and the dream, it shows how modernised football itself is object and subject in processes of
both neo-liberal globalisation and counter hegemonic globalisation.

While the contributions highlight characteristics of particular local and national contexts, the volume focuses
on global centre-periphery-relations and migration trajectories of football professionals by analysing recent
developments in post-colonial Portuguese speaking areas: The high ranking of "Portuguese football" not only
serves in national(ist) discourses or in order to emancipate the country from a marginal position, it also turns
Portugal into a football-talent exporter, confronting it partly with the same ambiguous consequences as
Brazil and the African countries, who "lose" their football talents to the European centre. The receiving
countries, again, include Portugal.

This book was previously published as a special issue of Soccer in Society
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From reader reviews:

Donovan Pena:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled Globalised Football: Nations and Migration, the City and the Dream
(Sport in the Global Society). Try to make the book Globalised Football: Nations and Migration, the City and
the Dream (Sport in the Global Society) as your pal. It means that it can to become your friend when you
really feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every little thing by the
book. So , we need to make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

David Munsch:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book called Globalised Football:
Nations and Migration, the City and the Dream (Sport in the Global Society)? Maybe it is to get best activity
for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than
before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Scott Frew:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can
easily share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their
reader with their story or even their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also
they write about the information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score
toefl, or how to teach your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these
days always try to improve their ability in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to
the book. One of them is this Globalised Football: Nations and Migration, the City and the Dream (Sport in
the Global Society).

David Barnett:

You may get this Globalised Football: Nations and Migration, the City and the Dream (Sport in the Global
Society) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve issue if you
get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only through written or printed but
additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by
your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information
about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try



to choose proper ways for you.
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