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Today, copyright is everywhere, surrounded by a thicket of no trespassing signs that mark creative work as
private property. Caren Irr’s Pink Pirates asks how contemporary novelists—represented by Ursula Le Guin,
Andrea Barrett, Kathy Acker, and Leslie Marmon Silko—have read those signs, arguing that for feminist
writers in particular copyright often conjures up the persistent exclusion of women from ownership. Bringing
together voices from law schools, courtrooms, and the writer's desk, Irr shows how some of the most
inventive contemporary feminist novelists have reacted to this history. 

 Explaining the complex, three-century lineage of Anglo-American copyright law in clear, accessible terms
and wrestling with some of copyright law's most deeply rooted assumptions, Irr sets the stage for a feminist
reappraisal of the figure of the literary pirate in the late twentieth century—a figure outside the restrictive
bounds of U.S. copyright statutes. 

 Going beyond her readings of contemporary women authors, Irr’s exhaustive history of how women have
fared under intellectual property regimes speaks to broader political, social, and economic implications and
engages digital-era excitement about the commons with the most utopian and materialist strains in feminist
criticism.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Hedrick:

The publication with title Pink Pirates: Contemporary American Women Writers and Copyright has lot of
information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new know-
how the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world right now. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you throughout
new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that
anywhere you want.

Jimmy Martinez:

The book Pink Pirates: Contemporary American Women Writers and Copyright has a lot info on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous
author. The writer makes some research previous to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you
will get the point easily after reading this book.

Edward Stevenson:

This Pink Pirates: Contemporary American Women Writers and Copyright is new way for you who has
interest to look for some information given it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you in it
getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having bit of digest in reading this Pink Pirates:
Contemporary American Women Writers and Copyright can be the light food for yourself because the
information inside that book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books build itself in the form that is
certainly reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So you cannot find any in
reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So ,
don't miss this! Just read this e-book style for your better life along with knowledge.

Luis Gazaway:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And also you
know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to
something by book. Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this
Pink Pirates: Contemporary American Women Writers and Copyright.
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