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In contrast to traditional combustion, gasification technologies offer the potential for converting coal and low
or negative-value feedstocks, such as petroleum coke and various waste materials into usable energy sources
or chemicals. With a growing number of companies operating and marketing systems based on gasification
concepts worldwide, this book combines the latest information and real-world experience in developing
gasification technologies.

Gasification Technologies: A Primer for Engineers and Scientists discusses gasification techniques and
the benefits of each technology, including gas clean-up technologies and those used in hybrid systems and
fuel cells. It also accounts for the primary products that are recovered and explains how these products are
purified and can be used as fuel or for applications in petrochemical processes. The book describes the
conditions in which optimal value intermediate products can be recovered, focusing on key factors such as
oxygen or air blown reactor, operating temperature, internal and external heating, and reactor design. The
authors also establish how gasification can help meet renewable energy targets, address concerns about
global warming, and contribute to a better carbon management or achieving Kyoto Protocol commitments.

Gasification Technologies provide a multidimensional and well-rounded examination of current technology,
research, applications, and development challenges for the commercialization of this increasingly popular
technology.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Sims:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take Gasification Technologies: A Primer for Engineers and
Scientists (Chemical Industries) as your daily resource information.

Jack Johnson:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Gasification Technologies: A Primer
for Engineers and Scientists (Chemical Industries), you can enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still
need to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy
it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

David Hoag:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you read
a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, along with
soon. The Gasification Technologies: A Primer for Engineers and Scientists (Chemical Industries) will give
you a new experience in studying a book.

Ellis Pauling:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or even
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or real their
pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this
period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Gasification Technologies: A Primer for Engineers and Scientists (Chemical
Industries) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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