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This ebook bundle contains the first four novels of the Thaddeus Lewis Mystery series. During the wild era
before Confederation, Thaddeus Lewis, a “saddlebag” preacher, mourns the mysterious death of his daughter
Sarah as he rides to his new posting in Prince Edward County. But soon other deaths hang over Lewis’s
head. And the list of suspects is growing …

“A four star selection that will be loved by all mystery fans.”

— Suspense Magazine

“Kellough does a fine job of bringing life to the times and to her ministerial hero on horseback.”

— The National Post

Includes:

The Burying Ground — Thaddeus Lewis Mystery #4 (NEW!)

Thaddeus reunites with an old friend in less-than-cheerful circumstances to catch a grave robber who is
preying on a vagrants’ cemetery and stealing more than bodies. The two soon find themselves entangled in a
mystery that stretches back to the typhus epidemic of 1847, and the legacy of a scandal many would prefer
left buried.

47 Sorrows — Thaddeus Lewis Mystery #3

In 1847 “Black” 100,000 Irish emigrants are fleeing to Canada. When a corpse washes up naked but for a
small green ribbon, the mystery exposes a vendetta that began in Ireland.

Sowing Poison — Thaddeus Lewis Mystery #2



The wife of a vanished man begins to hold seances for villagers, claiming she can contact the dead.
Thaddeus’s ethical objections propel him on a twisted path.

On the Head of a Pin — Thaddeus Lewis Mystery #1

With a serial killer loose in Upper Canada, Lewis must track the culprit across a colony convulsed by
invasion and fear. His only clues are a Book of Proverbs and a small painted pin left with the victims.
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From reader reviews:

Randell Easley:

The book Thaddeus Lewis Mysteries 4-Book Bundle: On the Head of a Pin / Sowing Poison / 47 Sorrows /
The Burying Ground (A Thaddeus Lewis Mystery) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time.
You need to use to make your capable far more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you
getting anxiety or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading a book Thaddeus Lewis
Mysteries 4-Book Bundle: On the Head of a Pin / Sowing Poison / 47 Sorrows / The Burying Ground (A
Thaddeus Lewis Mystery) to be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your current
capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and
read a e-book Thaddeus Lewis Mysteries 4-Book Bundle: On the Head of a Pin / Sowing Poison / 47
Sorrows / The Burying Ground (A Thaddeus Lewis Mystery). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Mary Wright:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right
now, people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than
other is high. For you who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of Thaddeus Lewis
Mysteries 4-Book Bundle: On the Head of a Pin / Sowing Poison / 47 Sorrows / The Burying Ground (A
Thaddeus Lewis Mystery) book as basic and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just
a book.

Douglas Ham:

The particular book Thaddeus Lewis Mysteries 4-Book Bundle: On the Head of a Pin / Sowing Poison / 47
Sorrows / The Burying Ground (A Thaddeus Lewis Mystery) has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read
this book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author. Tom makes some
research previous to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you will get the point easily after
looking over this book.

Catherine Graziani:

As a pupil exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's internal or real
their pastime. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on this
era, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.



Therefore this Thaddeus Lewis Mysteries 4-Book Bundle: On the Head of a Pin / Sowing Poison / 47
Sorrows / The Burying Ground (A Thaddeus Lewis Mystery) can make you experience more interested to
read.
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