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E’ la presentazione di una raccolta di poesie di chiara ispirazione Neoplatonica. I versi del poeta, vissuto nel
secolo appena trascorso, dal tono classico-decadentista, in realtà nascondono un messaggio esoterico
permeato da puro misticismo neoplatonico-cristiano. Il curatore, in tale raccolta, evidenzia un parallelismo
tra il poeta in oggetto e Giovanni Pascoli, il quale, nonostante primeggi nella letteratura italiana, è stato
oggetto di interpretazioni piuttosto riduttive da parte della critica, almeno fino alla fine del XX secolo.
Interessante sarà quindi, sia la lettura di queste poesie (perfette, tra l’altro, dal punto di vista accademico ma
ricche altresì, come per il Pascoli, di puro messaggio gnostico) sia il singolare parallelismo che, grazie al
curatore, rivela la vera essenza metafisica che lega i due poeti.
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From reader reviews:

Latrice Miller:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great and important the book Le poesie del quaderno (Italian
Edition). All type of book can you see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other
social media.

Brian Crafton:

Typically the book Le poesie del quaderno (Italian Edition) will bring you to definitely the new experience
of reading any book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book you
just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Le poesie del quaderno (Italian Edition) is much
recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can easier to read
the book.

Cedric Baker:

The reason? Because this Le poesie del quaderno (Italian Edition) is an unordinary book that the inside of the
book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book
alongside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such awesome way makes the content inside
easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you
a lot of gains than the other book include such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking
technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Donald Lester:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but also native
or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know those ebooks
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. Through the
book Le poesie del quaderno (Italian Edition) we can acquire more advantage. Don't someone to be creative
people? For being creative person must want to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your
aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life by this book Le poesie del quaderno (Italian Edition). You
can more desirable than now.
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