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From the acclaimed author of Trouble Loves Company comes a smart, sexy, heartfelt new novel about
friendship, love, lust--and a whole lot of trouble in between.

After finding her husband in a compromising position, romance author Renee Moore goes back to her
hometown, hoping to start over. But once again, she finds herself looking for love in all the wrong places. To
make matters worse, just as she decides a healthy relationship may not be her destiny, her ex delivers
shocking news that could change her life forever.

Practical nurse Danielle Brooks' professional life is picture perfect, but her personal life is a mess. Her
daughter is about to give birth to a baby believed to have been fathered by Danielle's ex. In an attempt to
mend her shattered heart, Danielle has been dating Calvin Cambridge, a truly nice guy. But when Calvin
proposes, Danielle wants to be sure she is ready to commit. She enlists Renee to test his fidelity, but when
the seduction goes too far, all their relationships may be in jeopardy.

Meanwhile, their best friend is getting married, and she is counting on Renee and Danielle to help her plan
the wedding--whether they are speaking to each other or not. But with Renee now being threatened by a
mystery woman, and Danielle facing her most serious crisis yet, they can not help wondering if it is all going
to get worse before it gets better.

As things come to a head in each woman's life, there is a whole lot of praying going on--and Renee and
Danielle soon realize they are blessed in spite of it all--with faith, second chances--and each other.
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From reader reviews:

Kelly McDowell:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Careful of the Company You Keep. Try to make the book Careful of
the Company You Keep as your pal. It means that it can to get your friend when you feel alone and beside
those of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book
makes you far more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let's make new
experience and also knowledge with this book.

Lisa Vazquez:

This Careful of the Company You Keep book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is definitely information inside this guide incredible
fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This
particular Careful of the Company You Keep without we understand teach the one who reading through it
become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry Careful of the Company You Keep can bring
any time you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in
the lovely laptop even phone. This Careful of the Company You Keep having great arrangement in word as
well as layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Margaret Burman:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also get a life style. This reading behavior give you lot of
advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book that improve
your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of book you read, if you want drive
more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience happy read one together with theme
for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The Careful of the Company You Keep is kind of publication
which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Jeff Keenan:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library
in order to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
soul or real their pastime. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this
time there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't
see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this Careful of the Company You Keep can make you feel more interested to read.
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