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California is one of the most ecologically rich and diverse regions of North America, and home to hundreds
of species of mushrooms. In California Mushrooms, mycologist experts Dennis Desjardin, Michael Wood,
and Fred Stevens provide over 1100 species profiles, including comprehensive descriptions and spectacular
photographs of 650 species. Each profile includes information on macro- and micromorphology, habitat,
edibility, and comparisons with closely related species and potential look-alikes.

Although the focus of the book is on mushrooms of California, over 90% of the species treated occur
elsewhere, making the book useful throughout western North America. California Mushrooms also provides
information on when and where to find mushrooms; guidelines on how to collect and identify mushrooms;
keys to species; and overviews of nomenclature and taxonomy, morphology and phylogeny, fungal ecology,
biology of mushrooms, and mushroom toxins. This complete reference covers everything necessary for the
mushroom hunter to accurately identify over 650 species.
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From reader reviews:

Eunice Bosse:

The book California Mushrooms give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make
your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem with your subject. If you can make looking at a book California Mushrooms for being your habit,
you can get much more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about many or
all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a publication California Mushrooms. Kinds
of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think
about this e-book?

Roxanne Harrelson:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book which
improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of e-book you read, if you
want attract knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want really feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual California Mushrooms is kind of
book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

James Hall:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find book that
need more time to be study. California Mushrooms can be your answer given it can be read by you actually
who have those short free time problems.

Matthew Russell:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This particular California Mushrooms can give you a lot of pals
because by you investigating this one book you have thing that they don't and make you more like an
interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer you
information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than other make you to be great
persons. So , why hesitate? Let's have California Mushrooms.
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