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This exploration of the radical, yet ancient, idea that everything and everyone is God will transform how you
understand your life and the nature of religion itself. While God is conventionally viewed as an entity
separate from us, there are some Jews—Kabbalists, Hasidim, and their modern-day heirs—who assert that
God is not separate from us at all. In this nondual view, everyone and everything manifests God. For
centuries a closely guarded secret of Kabbalah, nondual Judaism is a radical reorientation of religious life
that is increasingly influencing mainstream Judaism today.

Writer and scholar Jay Michaelson presents a wide-ranging and compelling explanation of nondual Judaism:
what it is, its traditional and contemporary sources, its historical roots and philosophical significance, how it
compares to nondual Buddhism and Hinduism, and how it is lived in practice. He explains what this mystical
nondual view means in our daily ego-centered lives, for our communities, and for the future of Judaism.
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From reader reviews:

Kathy Vaughn:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Everything Is God: The Radical Path of Nondual Judaism.

Sarah Brumfield:

The particular book Everything Is God: The Radical Path of Nondual Judaism will bring someone to the new
experience of reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to
find new book to read, this book very suitable to you. The book Everything Is God: The Radical Path of
Nondual Judaism is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web
site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Christopher Hartwick:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
better to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to
you personally is Everything Is God: The Radical Path of Nondual Judaism this publication consist a lot of
the information from the condition of this world now. This book was represented just how can the world has
grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made
some investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.

Henry Brown:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Everything Is God: The Radical
Path of Nondual Judaism which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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