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A critical study of Persius' poetic aims, aversions and techniques, based mainly on an extended analysis of
Satires I. John Bramble shows how Persius' discontent with conventional literary language led him to
compress the existing satiric idiom and create a powerful individual style. The author situates Persius' work
in the tradition of Roman satire, and shows how he takes the concepts and metaphors of literary criticism
back to their physical origins, to indict moral and literary decadence through a series of images connected
with, for example, gluttony and sexual excess. This is a model study of a classical text, which makes
consistent sense of a difficult and subtle manner, and answers questions posed by the potentially constricting
nature of Roman poetic form. It also reconstructs the referential framework of ideas and associations upon
which a sophisticated writer addressing a discriminating audience could draw.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Belser:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the item for a
while is reading. That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to
endure than other is high. For you who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular Persius and
the Programmatic Satire: A Study in Form and Imagery (Cambridge Classical Studies) book as nice and
daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Wayne Martin:

The e-book untitled Persius and the Programmatic Satire: A Study in Form and Imagery (Cambridge
Classical Studies) is the book that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the guide content
that will be shown to an individual. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to
understand. The article author was did a lot of investigation when write the book, therefore the information
that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Persius and the Programmatic
Satire: A Study in Form and Imagery (Cambridge Classical Studies) from the publisher to make you much
more enjoy free time.

Michael Palmateer:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book and also novel and Persius and the Programmatic Satire: A
Study in Form and Imagery (Cambridge Classical Studies) or maybe others sources were given
understanding for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science
e-book was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to add their knowledge.
In different case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Persius and the Programmatic Satire: A Study
in Form and Imagery (Cambridge Classical Studies) to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types
of book like this one.

Joseph Dolezal:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know that
little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is very
important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. Amount types
of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually Persius and the Programmatic



Satire: A Study in Form and Imagery (Cambridge Classical Studies).
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