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From The Louisiana Purchase

Like many other major events in world history, the Louisiana Purchase is a fascinating mix of destiny and
individual energy and creativity. . . . Thomas Jefferson would have been less than human had he not claimed
a major share of the credit. In a private letter . . . the president, reviving a favorite metaphor, said he "very
early saw" Louisiana was a "speck" that could turn into a "tornado." He added that the public never knew
how near "this catastrophe was." But he decided to calm the hotheads of the west and "endure" Napoleon's
aggression, betting that a war with England would force Bonaparte to sell. This policy "saved us from the
storm." Omitted almost entirely from this account is the melodrama of the purchase, so crowded with "what
ifs" that might have changed the outcome-and the history of the world.

The reports of the Lewis and Clark expedition . . . electrified the nation with their descriptions of a region of
broad rivers and rich soil, of immense herds of buffalo and other game, of grassy prairies seemingly as
illimitable as the ocean. . . . From the Louisiana Purchase would come, in future decades, the states of
Arkansas, Missouri, Iowa, Nebraska, South Dakota, and large portions of what is now North Dakota,
Montana, Wyoming, Minnesota, Colorado, and Louisiana. For the immediate future, the purchase, by
doubling the size of the United States, transformed it from a minor to a major world power. The emboldened
Americans soon absorbed West and East Florida and fought mighty England to a bloody stalemate in the
War of 1812. Looking westward, the orators of the 1840s who preached the "Manifest Destiny" of the United
States to preside from sea to shining sea based their oratorical logic on the Louisiana Purchase.

TURNING POINTS features preeminent writers offering fresh, personal perspectives on the defining events
of our time.
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From reader reviews:

Paul McKinney:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They may be reading whatever
they have because their hobby will be reading a book. How about the person who don't like reading through
a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book after they found difficult problem as well as exercise.
Well, probably you will want this The Louisiana Purchase (Turning Points in History).

Eric Langley:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book mainly book
entitled The Louisiana Purchase (Turning Points in History) your thoughts will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can be your mind friends.
Imaging each word written in a publication then become one application form conclusion and explanation
that will maybe you never get just before. The The Louisiana Purchase (Turning Points in History) giving
you another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful info for your better
life within this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind
will likely be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Tammy Jones:

The Louisiana Purchase (Turning Points in History) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. All of
us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge
in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The article
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing The Louisiana Purchase
(Turning Points in History) however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest in addition
to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can drawn you
into brand new stage of crucial thinking.

Jordan Miller:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library as well as to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has
reading's internal or real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library.
They go to generally there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not
important, boring along with can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is
very important in your case. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise
word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this The Louisiana Purchase (Turning Points in



History) can make you feel more interested to read.
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