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Muskrat for Supper inspires young people to explore nature's life cycles and understand the concept of the
circle of life, as told through the tale of a family that embarks on a hunting and trapping adventure. It is an
endearing story that weaves together such themes as sustainable living, our natural environment, and living
closer to nature. The first book for children by this acclaimed storyteller and author, Muskrat for Supper
includes questions young people have asked Kenny Salwey about his lifestyle as a river rat living off the
land. The story will be illustrated with black-and-white photographs as well as nonfiction material to
supplement the text.

Kenny Salwey is the last of a breed of men whose lifestyle has all but disappeared in this fast-paced, high-
tech digital world. For thirty years, this weathered woodsman eked out a living on the Mississippi River
running a trapline, hiring out as a river guide, digging and selling roots and herbs, and eating the food he
hunted and fished. Today Salwey is a master storyteller, environmental educator, keynote speaker, nature
writer, and advocate for the Upper Mississippi River. He has presented his true-life adventures and words of
natural world wisdom to both adult and young audiences across the upper Midwest. By sharing his hard-
learned experiences, his respect for the Mississippi River, and his love of the natural world, Salwey hopes to
inspire his audiences to protect this precious and fragile ecosystem.
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From reader reviews:

Yasmin Parker:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Muskrat for Supper: Exploring the Natural World with the Last River
Rat. Try to stumble through book Muskrat for Supper: Exploring the Natural World with the Last River Rat
as your good friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you feel alone and beside those of course
make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you far more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Scottie Kelly:

The book Muskrat for Supper: Exploring the Natural World with the Last River Rat can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book
Muskrat for Supper: Exploring the Natural World with the Last River Rat? Several of you have a different
opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try
to closer with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you
are able to share all of these. Book Muskrat for Supper: Exploring the Natural World with the Last River Rat
has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can appear the enormous
world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Robert Knight:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading habit give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what
kind of guide you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want truly
feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Typically the Muskrat for
Supper: Exploring the Natural World with the Last River Rat is kind of e-book which is giving the reader
unforeseen experience.

Richard Strohm:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its cover may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer is usually Muskrat for Supper: Exploring the Natural World with the
Last River Rat why because the amazing cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not
disappoint you. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th



sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.
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