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The book you are about to read is destined to be the first, middle, and maybe even the last word on
nonfiction writing for young, young children. It is certainly a text that you will return to over and over again
as you do with a beloved cookbook.
—from the Foreword by Tomie dePaola

Over eighty- five percent of the reading and writing we do as adults is nonfiction, yet most of the reading and
writing in K–3 classrooms is fiction or personal narrative. In Is That a Fact? Teaching Nonfiction Writing K-
3, Tony Stead shows you how to open the door to the rich world of nonfiction writing that goes beyond
"what I did" narratives and animal reports. And he convincingly demonstrates the importance of introducing
nonfiction writing in the primary grades.

Nonfiction inspires enthusiasm in young children because they can choose topics that are of interest to them
personally. Is That a Fact? explores a variety of authentic purposes for writing nonfiction, such as
describing, explaining, instructing, persuading, retelling, and exploring relationships with others. You will
learn how to introduce each purpose using a variety of forms, including letters, reports, poetry, captions,
directions, and interviews.

Part One provides a complete overview of teaching nonfiction writing in the primary grades and includes:

practical ways for organizing nonfiction resources within the classroom;●

how to assist children in collecting information for research;●

ideas for helping children keep their sense of voice when writing nonfiction;●

a chapter on spelling, with examples of how to guide students at each stage of spelling development;●

strategies for assessment and evaluation that guide teaching and learning engagements.●

Part Two provides five different explorations that were implemented in actual K–3 classrooms. Each focuses
on a specific purpose for writing nonfiction and features:

examples of whole-class, small-group, and independent instructional engagements;●

a comprehensive assessment rubric that will help teachers tailor instruction to the needs of all learners;●

an extensive resource section that includes lists of books in the exploration, grouped by readability levels;●

answers to the most commonly asked questions about teaching nonfiction writing.●

The appendixes include a self-assessment questionnaire, reproducible pages for exploring specific writing
forms, and letters to parents.

Children need to be introduced to the different purposes of nonfiction writing. They need to know how to
plan, compose, revise, and publish nonfiction beyond narrative. Is That a Fact? guides you in achieving
these goals with your students.
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From reader reviews:

Aaron Jack:

The book Is That a Fact? give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your
capable far more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem
along with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Is That a Fact? to become your habit, you
can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all
subjects. You may know everything if you like available and read a publication Is That a Fact?. Kinds of
book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this
reserve?

Agnes Shivers:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yeah, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand up than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this Is That a Fact? book as
beginning and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Norman Brown:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book can be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want
to try out look for book, may be the e-book untitled Is That a Fact? can be great book to read. May be it is
usually best activity to you.

Travis Berry:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul
or real their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along with
can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As
we know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Is That a Fact? can make you experience more interested to read.
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