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Given the central role played by religion in early-modern Britain, it is perhaps surprising that historians have
not always paid close attention to the shifting and nuanced subtleties of terms used in religious controversies.
In this collection particular attention is focussed upon two of the most contentious of these terms: ’atheism’
and ’deism’, terms that have shaped significant parts of the scholarship on the Enlightenment. This volume
argues that in the seventeenth and eighteenth century atheism and deism involved fine distinctions that have
not always been preserved by later scholars. The original deployment and usage of these terms were often
more complicated than much of the historical scholarship suggests. Indeed, in much of the literature static
definitions are often taken for granted, resulting in depictions of the past constructed upon anachronistic
assumptions. Offering reassessments of the historical figures most associated with ’atheism’ and ’deism’ in
early modern Britain, this collection opens the subject up for debate and shows how the new historiography
of deism changes our understanding of heterodox religious identities in Britain from 1650 to 1800. It
problematises the older view that individuals were atheist or deists in a straightforward sense and instead
explores the plurality and flexibility of religious identities during this period. Drawing on the most recent
scholarship, the volume enriches the debate about heterodoxy, offering new perspectives on a range of
prominent figures and providing an overview of major changes in the field.
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From reader reviews:

Hollie Hoffman:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox Religious Identities in
Britain, 1650-1800. Try to stumble through book Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox Religious
Identities in Britain, 1650-1800 as your friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you really feel
alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs.
The book makes you more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let me make new
experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Anne Bonk:

This Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox Religious Identities in Britain, 1650-1800 book is just not
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is
information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper a person read
a lot of information you will get. This specific Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox Religious Identities
in Britain, 1650-1800 without we realize teach the one who reading it become critical in thinking and
analyzing. Don't end up being worry Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox Religious Identities in
Britain, 1650-1800 can bring any time you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' become full
because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox
Religious Identities in Britain, 1650-1800 having very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you
will not feel uninterested in reading.

Jeffrey Lambert:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox
Religious Identities in Britain, 1650-1800 reserve written by well-known writer we are excited for well how
to make book which can be understand by anyone who read the book. Written with good manner for you,
still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still
question Atheism and Deism Revalued: Heterodox Religious Identities in Britain, 1650-1800 as good book
not simply by the cover but also through the content. This is one guide that can break don't assess book by its
protect, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense
already alerted you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Angela Bauer:

In this particular era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are
more precious than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have
that. What you need to do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some



books. One of many books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually Atheism and Deism Revalued:
Heterodox Religious Identities in Britain, 1650-1800. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry
Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking right up and review this e-book
you can get many advantages.
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