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Financial advisors, poker players, hedge fund traders, fund-raisers, sports agents, credit counselors and
commissioned salespeople all deal with one central concern in their jobs: money. In Money at Work, Kevin
Delaney explores how we think about money and, particularly, how our jobs influence that thinking. By
spotlighting people for whom money is the focus of their work, Delaney illuminates how the daily practices
experienced in different jobs create distinct ways of thinking and talking about money and how occupations
and their work cultures carry important symbolic, material, and practical messages about money.

Delaney takes us deep inside the cultures of these ‘moneyed’ workers, using both interviews and first-hand
observations of many of these occupations.  From hedge fund trading rooms in New York, to poker players
at work in Las Vegas casinos, to a “Christian money retreat” in a monastery in rural Pennsylvania, Delaney
illustrates how the underlying economic conditions of various occupations and careers produce what he calls
“money cultures,” or ways of understanding the meaning of money, which in turn shape one’s economic
outlook. Key to this is how some professionals, such as debt counselors, think very differently than say poker
players in their regard to money—Delaney argues that it is the structure of these professions themselves that
in turn influences monetary attitudes. Fundamentally, Money at Work shows that what people do for a living
has a profound effect on how people conceive of money both at work and in their home lives, making clear
the connections between the economic and the social, shedding light on some of our most basic values. At a
time when conversations about money are increasingly important, Delaney shows that we do not merely
learn our attitudes toward money in childhood, but we also learn important money lessons from the work that
we do.
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From reader reviews:

Clarence Hamm:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different
to fill your own free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill your no cost time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to consider
look for book, may be the reserve untitled Money at Work: On the Job with Priests, Poker Players and Hedge
Fund Traders can be good book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Javier Link:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is Money at Work: On the Job with Priests, Poker Players and Hedge Fund
Traders this e-book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was
represented just how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy
to understand. The writer made some research when he makes this book. Here is why this book acceptable
all of you.

Amanda Acuna:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Money at Work: On the Job
with Priests, Poker Players and Hedge Fund Traders which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try
out this book? Let's view.

Joseph Levis:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you also
know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something by book. Numerous
books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them are these claims Money at Work: On the Job
with Priests, Poker Players and Hedge Fund Traders.
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