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From Book 1: They're the daughters of celebrities--the kind all the teen mags gossip about! But the It Girls
of Hollywood High are about to discover that fame has a price. And no friendship--or romance--is safe. . .

London Phillips will diet as her mother demands. She'll even date the billionaire her mother has chosen for
her. But she won't give up her secret hottie, Justice Banks. She and Justice plan to elope--right after he
becomes a hip-hop superstar. All he has to do is seduce a media mogul's darling daughter, Rich
Montgomery, and a record deal is his! But he better remember London is really his girl. . .

Rich is so lucky to have a BFF like London. It was London who introduced her to dreamy Justice. Little does
she know that her new heartthrob is about to cause a media explosion that will change this spoiled princess's
life forever. . .

Spencer Ellington hates to see a billionaire go to waste. That's why she's hooking up with London's
boyfriend, Anderson Ford. London may not be in love with Anderson, but she believes he'll do anything for
her. Just wait till she finds out the only thing Anderson is doing is Spencer. . .

Heather Cummings wants in with the It Girls to secure the spotlight for her actress mother.

But when she stumbles upon a secret about the father she never knew, she discovers she has ties to the clique
so scandalous it may just bring Hollywood High's in-crowd to their knees!

"Simone tells authentic stories of teen life in the 'hood better than any other author currently writing
contemporary YA street lit." --Library Journal on Teenage Love Affair (starred review)
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From reader reviews:

Herbert Beckley:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Hollywood High (4 Book Series) will make you to
possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think
which open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they could be thought like
that? Have you searching for best book or suited book with you?

Lauren Marine:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to
do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in
the top list in your reading list is actually Hollywood High (4 Book Series). This book which can be qualified
as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking upwards and
review this book you can get many advantages.

Raymond Llamas:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Hollywood High (4 Book Series) was colorful
and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Hollywood High (4 Book Series) has many kinds
or category. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe
that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers up you
feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading in which.

Michael Bradley:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is prepared or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of news. On this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social such
as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the
Hollywood High (4 Book Series) when you required it?
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