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More than 80,000 HR professionals having earned the Senior Professional in Human Resources (SPHR) or
Professional in Human Resources (PHR) certification, and another 20,000 are expected to take the exam in
2009. This complete update of the bestselling guide to HR certification contains additional coverage of new
HR policies and standards, as well as updated practice exam questions and real world scenarios. Key topics
include strategic management, workforce planning and employment, compensation and benefits, employee
and labor relations, and Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA) regulations. The CD-ROM
contains two bonus exams (one each for PHR and SPHR) as well as flashcards and an electronic book.

Note: CD-ROM/DVD and other supplementary materials are not included as part of eBook file.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Callender:

The book PHR / SPHR Professional in Human Resources Certification Study Guide make one feel enjoy for
your spare time. You can use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can for being your best friend
when you getting anxiety or having big problem with your subject. If you can make examining a book PHR /
SPHR Professional in Human Resources Certification Study Guide for being your habit, you can get much
more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. It is possible to
know everything if you like available and read a reserve PHR / SPHR Professional in Human Resources
Certification Study Guide. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some
others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Nancy Lowery:

The book PHR / SPHR Professional in Human Resources Certification Study Guide will bring that you the
new experience of reading any book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In case you try to
find new book you just read, this book very ideal to you. The book PHR / SPHR Professional in Human
Resources Certification Study Guide is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-
book from official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

James Bergeron:

Exactly why? Because this PHR / SPHR Professional in Human Resources Certification Study Guide is an
unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will jolt you with
the secret the item inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it.
This excellent book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book possess such as help improving your
skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to
the e-book store hurriedly.

Alexander Snider:

PHR / SPHR Professional in Human Resources Certification Study Guide can be one of your nice books that
are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will
increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the
information. The writer giving his/her effort to place every word into pleasure arrangement in writing PHR /
SPHR Professional in Human Resources Certification Study Guide but doesn't forget the main level, giving
the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one among it. This
great information can drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.
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