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After Haiti was struck by a devastating earthquake on January 12, 2010, aid workers and offers of support
poured in from around the world. Tellingly, though, news reports on the catastrophe and relief efforts
frequently included a pejorative description of the country that outsiders were determined to rebuild: the
troubled island nation, a nation plagued by political violence. There was much talk of inventing a “new”
Haiti, which would presumably mimic Western modes of development and thus mitigate political instability
and crisis.

As contributors to this wide-ranging book reveal, Haiti has long been marginalized as an embodiment of
alterity, as the other, and the idea of a new Haiti is actually nothing new. An investigation of the notion of
newness through the lenses of history and literature, urban planning, religion, and governance, The Idea of
Haiti illuminates the politics and the narratives of Haiti’s past and present. The essays, which grow from
original research and in-depth interviews, examine how race, class, and national development inform the
policies that envision re-creating the country.

Together the contributors address important questions: How will the present narratives of deviance affect
international relief and rebuilding efforts? What do Haitians themselves think about Haiti, old and new?
What are the potential complications and weakness of aid strategies during these trying times? And what do
we mean by crisis in Haiti?

Contributors: Yveline Alexis, Rutgers U; Wein Weibert Arthus, State U of Haiti; Greg Beckett, Bowdoin
College; Alex Dupuy, Wesleyan U; Harley F. Etienne, U of Michigan; Robert Fatton Jr., U of Virginia;
Sibylle Fischer, New York U; Elizabeth McAlister, Wesleyan U; Nick Nesbitt, Princeton U; Karen Richman,
U of Notre Dame; Mark Schuller, York College (CUNY); Patrick Sylvain, Brown U; Évelyne Trouillot,
State U of Haiti; Tatiana Wah, Columbia U.
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn Nielson:

The book The Idea of Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and Development gives you the sense of being enjoy for your
spare time. You need to use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best friend when
you getting strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make studying a book The Idea of
Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and Development being your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your
own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you
like available and read a e-book The Idea of Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and Development. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this e-
book?

Pauline Mueller:

The actual book The Idea of Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and Development will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book to learn, this book very appropriate to you. The book The Idea of Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and
Development is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from your official web site,
so you can more easily to read the book.

Linda Wood:

The reason why? Because this The Idea of Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and Development is an unordinary book
that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap that but latter it will shock you with the secret this
inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such amazing way makes
the content inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This excellent book
will give you a lot of benefits than the other book have got such as help improving your proficiency and your
critical thinking means. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the guide
store hurriedly.

Steve Pinson:

This The Idea of Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and Development is great e-book for you because the content
which is full of information for you who always deal with world and also have to make decision every
minute. This kind of book reveal it facts accurately using great arrange word or we can point out no rambling
sentences within it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only
offers you straight forward sentences but hard core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having
The Idea of Haiti: Rethinking Crisis and Development in your hand like having the world in your arm, data
in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen
minute right but this book already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs.
stressful do you still doubt in which?
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