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Syd Callens moves to Augusta, Ga six weeks before the start of ninth grade and her beloved father's funeral.
Syd proudly withdraws, refusing to cry at her father's funeral: She wallows in grief, resisting help from her
mother or the outside, including an extension of friendship from Seth, her first crush-a boy who's already
spoken for and whose eyes look like the deep end of the pool. She also deals with the ensuing humiliation
that comes when a girl realizes that everyone at school has mistaken her for a boy. Syd feels an instant
connection to Mel, a fellow oddball who clunks around Greenbrier in army boots and dresses. The attraction
turns to mistrust however, when Mel divulges a secret Sydney takes for a lie. The girls are mere inches from
forging a friendship but then Mel mysteriously disappears, leaving Sydney alone to wonder what happened
and to face daily abuse from Greenbrier's two meanest girls-Ashley and Megan.
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From reader reviews:

Mona Savoy:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming
to anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Onion Girl is our recommendation so you
keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Erin Kizer:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always
try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write on their book. One of
them is this Onion Girl.

Kevin Pennell:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book
that need more time to be examine. Onion Girl can be your answer because it can be read by an individual
who have those short time problems.

Elizabeth Smith:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book Onion Girl was vibrant and of course has pictures around.
As we know that book Onion Girl has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until youngsters. For example
Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of
book are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you
and try to like reading in which.
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